
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 20-20072

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Various Types of Face Masks/Respirators
TIME &  
DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 17, 2020  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 
 

 68,880.00 95,760.00 51,800.00    
 
 

 TOTAL 10,800.00 2,080.00 2,800.00  7,370.00 5,520.00

GROUP 3 FABRIC UNIT
1,000 ea. PRICE 0.40 0.624 0.70 0.71 0.79 0.83

1. Fabric Delivered on July 31, 2020 TOTAL 400.00 624.00 700.00 710.00 790.00 830.00
UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 0.40 0.624 0.70 0.71 0.79 0.83
2. Fabric Delivered on September 1, 2020 TOTAL 400.00 624.00 700.00 710.00 790.00 830.00

UNIT
1,000 ea. PRICE 0.40 0.624 0.70 0.71 0.79 0.83

3. Fabric Delivered on October 1, 2020 TOTAL 400.00 624.00 700.00 710.00 790.00 830.00
 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 0.40 0.624 0.70 0.71 0.79 0.83
4. Fabric Delivered on November 2, 2020 TOTAL 400.00 624.00 700.00 710.00 790.00 830.00

  
  

 GROUP 3 TOTAL TOTAL 1,600.00 2,496.00 2,800.00 2,840.00 3,160.00 3,320.00
Desired delivery to be completed per the schedule below. *
If July 31, 2020 is not possible for the first delivery indicated the next
available date: 10-13 days  

Net Net 1% Net Net Net
 Terms 30 days 30 days 7 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

agragg@teamocti.com
alexsanchez@electricsupplysource.com hli@teamoneintegration.com chip.marshall@coleparmer.com
AMayo@labtopiainc.com hp@micro‐design.com cole.wilson@graybar.com
ambroh@mbroh.com hrivera@hces.net Darrell.George@ergotron.com
avarela@hach.com info@water‐monitor.com David.Burns@emerson.com
Bailey@cbsolutionslp.com ivara@electricsupplysource.com david@tornadoautomation.com
ben.yoash@federalresources.com james.carrales@c2engineer.com dbejar@dealerselectrical.com
blee@blti.com jaredjohnson@mercedesmed.com Devin.Barrera@vectorcag.com
bpappel@midlandsci.com jdaniel@vectorcag.com dlee@bltechnology.com
bphilpy@vectorcag.com  jharnett@ced6778sa.com doug@ced6778sa.com
brandon.holby@hach.com jhollway@macaulaycontrols.com earnesthoov@outlook.com
braycobusinessservices@gmail.com JMichael@vfd.com energyelectric@comcast.net
Brianv@mcesi.com ccortez@macaulaycontrols.com eulpaula@aol.co  
bwegener@hach.com CEkonomakis@blti.com gail@cbsolutions  

 gilbert.aguillon@summit.com
 hjhidalgo@sig‐auto.com

 GROUP 1 UNDER REVIEW (8/21/20)

 GROUP 2 CANCELLED 
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48,160.00   62,860.00 59,500.00 59,500.00 67,970.00 38,360.00   66,500.00 58,800.00  

8,240.00  18,000.00 10,000.00   14,500.00 19,960.00 10,490.00  9,800.00 46,000.00 11,960.00

0.91 1.10 0.95 0.99 1.10 1.10 1.50 1.19 1.90 1.49 1.60 1.85 1.99
910.00 1,100.00 950.00 990.00 1,100.00 1,100.00 1,500.00 1,190.00 1,900.00 1,490.00 1,600.00 1,850.00 1,990.00

0.91 0.95 0.95 0.99 1.10 1.10 1.00 1.19 1.31 1.49 1.60 1.85 1.99
910.00 950.00 950.00 990.00 1,100.00 1,100.00 1,000.00 1,190.00 1,310.00 1,490.00 1,600.00 1,850.00 1,990.00

0.91 0.90 0.95 0.99 1.10 1.10 1.00 1.19 1.31 1.49 1.60 1.85 1.99
910.00 900.00 950.00 990.00 1,100.00 1,100.00 1,000.00 1,190.00 1,310.00 1,490.00 1,600.00 1,850.00 1,990.00

0.91 0.80 0.95 0.99 1.10 1.10 1.00 1.19 1.31 1.49 1.60 1.85 1.99
910.00 800.00 950.00 990.00 1,100.00 1,100.00 1,000.00 1,190.00 1,310.00 1,490.00 1,600.00 1,850.00 1,990.00

3,640.00 3,750.00 3,800.00 3,960.00 4,400.00 4,400.00 4,500.00 4,760.00 5,830.00 5,960.00 6,400.00 7,400.00 7,960.00

 Aug. 7, 2020 Aug. 14, 2020  30 days

15% Net Net 1% Net Net Net Net 3% Net Net Net 2.5%
1 day 30 days 30 days 15 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 10 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 10 daya

 

joy@grubbengineering.com nsheen@techstaris.com takoohy@heiworld.com
jr.stendebach@hach.com peter.guerrero@mission‐controls.com tamra.roberts@bray.com
juanital@mcesi.com Psapp@municipalvalve.com tdisser@butlerandland.com
justin.parker@gdicgovcon.com RebeccaR@phenova.com tmcclendon@butlerandland.com
KHOLLWAY@MACAULAYCONTROLS.COM rkrause@butlerandland.com tonyp@carrollcommunications.guru
kmccann@mercedesmed.com rob.kessler@avcalibrationstx.com traci@safetysupplyinc.com
liz@jrsaengineering.com ross@ced6778sa.com tsmith@butlerandland.com
lorenzo.cisneros@mission‐controls.com rschmi@dealerselectrical.com vkgupta@gaiconsulting.com
lstoddard@syscontrols.com RVautherot@hannainst.com zane@tornadoautomation.com
mario.delgado@helifox.com  sales@expotechusa.com zross@techstaris.com
MFraser@mercedesmed.com scotty@jcsindustries.us.com sfaulstich@qualityfasteners.com
mg@asctoday.com sdame@dealerselectrical.com jnorris@gulfcoastpaper.com 
mhatton@techstaris.com Shadeh.Parker@calumetspecialty.com MHernandez@trueflavors.com
mishelle.mgmcontrols@taylortel.net ssmith@dealerselectrical.com george@brandstitchink.com
mmautoandtruckparts@gmail.com stond@fordav.com
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   15,400.00  83,860.00 60,200.00 36,400.00  69,300.00  40,810.00 51,660.00  

  12,000.00 5,200.00  13,560.00 9,200.00 10,200.00 13,000.00  9,600.00 14,860.00 15,560.00  

2.00 2.00 2.00 2.10 2.17 2.25 2.30 2.50 2.72 3.10 3.55 3.84 3.89 4.79
2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,100.00 2,170.00 2,250.00 2,300.00 2,500.00 2,720.00 3,100.00 3,550.00 3,840.00 3,890.00 4,790.00

2.00 2.00 2.00 2.10 2.17 2.25 2.30 2.50 2.72 3.10 3.55 3.79 3.89 4.79
2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,100.00 2,170.00 2,250.00 2,300.00 2,500.00 2,720.00 3,100.00 3,550.00 3,790.00 3,890.00 4,790.00

2.00 2.00 2.00 2.10 2.17 2.25 2.30 2.50 2.72 3.10 3.55 3.64 3.89 4.79
2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,100.00 2,170.00 2,250.00 2,300.00 2,500.00 2,720.00 3,100.00 3,550.00 3,640.00 3,890.00 4,790.00

2.00 2.00 2.00 2.10 2.17 2.25 2.30 2.50 2.72 3.10 3.55 3.59 3.89 4.79
2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,100.00 2,170.00 2,250.00 2,300.00 2,500.00 2,720.00 3,100.00 3,550.00 3,590.00 3,890.00 4,790.00

8,000.00 8,000.00 8,000.00 8,400.00 8,680.00 9,000.00 9,200.00 10,000.00 10,880.00 12,400.00 14,200.00 14,860.00 15,560.00 19,160.00

 
Aug. 31, 2020 Aug. 15, 2020

Net Net Net 5% Net 2% Net 0.16% Net 2% Net Net Net Net
30 days 30 days 30 days 15 days 30 days 10 days 30 days 1 day 30 days 10 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
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45,920.00 56,000.00 119,000.00 61,460.00 82,740.00 47,460.00 150,500.00 59,500.00 69,300.00

 
         

5.00 7.00 7.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
5,000.00 7,000.00 7,500.00       

5.00 7.00 7.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
5,000.00 7,000.00 7,500.00       

5.00 7.00 7.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
5,000.00 7,000.00 7,500.00       

5.00 7.00 7.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
5,000.00 7,000.00 7,500.00       

20,000.00 28,000.00 30,000.00       

20-30 days

Net Net Net Net 2% Net 1% 5% Net
30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 10 days 30 days 10 days 10 days 30 days
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